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Citrus auto degreaser (C.A.D)

This is heavy duty, emulsifiable solvent degreaser which is 
composed of both petroleum solvents PLUS citrus solvents, 
dispersing agents, emulsifiers, wetting agents, and corrosion 
inhibitors. This product is intended to be used for the removal 
of stubborn soils such as grease, oils, dirt, waxes, tar and 
asphalt. Due to the chemical composition of this product, it 
may be used as a spray-on/flush off degreaser, as an 
immersion tank cleaner, or to degrease heavily soiled concrete 
floors. Automobiles, trucks, tractors, farm equipment, 
construction equipment, tar and asphalt equipment, motors, 
metal parts, and any surface not harmed by kerosene may be 
cleaned and degreased with this product. 

Maintenance shops, garages, industrial plants, commercial 
building and equipment maintenance, or virtually anywhere 
economical degreasing is a must.

Based on deposition and degree of soil, dilute product as 
indicated above. Spray or brush on solution to area to be 
cleaned. Allow to penetrate for 10 to 20 minutes, then flush off 
with water under pressure. For immersion tank cleaning of 
parts,use the same solvent dilution ratios above.Soak part for 
10   to   20  Minutes,  then  flush  away  soil  with  water  under 

pressure. For cleaning of concrete floors, spray or mop 
solution on floor. Agitate with a stiff brush. Flush clean with 
water.

According to degree of soil, dilute product as indicated 
above. Spray or brush on solution to area to be cleaned. 
Allow to penetrate for 10 to 20 minutes, then flush off with 
water under pressure. For immersion tank cleaning of parts, 
use the same solvent dilution ratios above. Soak parts for 10 
to 20 minutes, then flush away soil with water under 
pressure. For cleaning of concrete floors, spray or mop 
solution on floor. Agitate with a stiff brush. Flush clean with 
water.

Introduction: 

Application: 

Dose: 

Technical Specification: 

Part/Order no: Packing 

RXSOL-10-1734-25

RXSOL-10-1734-210

25 Ltr

210 Ltr
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